
From: Kelly Bacon (CD)
To: "tslcinc@yahoo.com"
Subject: RE: CB-21-00002 Santjer - Conditional Preliminary Approval
Date: Wednesday, December 22, 2021 10:52:03 AM
Importance: High

Good morning,
 
I wanted to check in on your taxes being paid in full.  This was the only portion of the process that
needed to be completed prior to finalizing.  If the taxes have been paid in full, please let me know
and I will proceed with finalizing your parcel combination.  After the first of the year, the 2022 taxes
would need to be paid in full prior to finalization.
 
Thank you,
 

Kelly Bacon
Planner I
Kittitas County Community Development Services
411 N. Ruby Street, Ste 2
Ellensburg, WA 98926
Office: (509) 962-7539
Kelly.bacon.cd@co.kittitas.wa.us
 
If this is a Public Records Request, please go to https://www.co.kittitas.wa.us/request/default.aspx and
fill out a request for public records through the GovQA portal.
 
 

From: Kelly Bacon (CD) 
Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2021 12:02 PM
To: 'tslcinc@yahoo.com' <tslcinc@yahoo.com>
Subject: CB-21-00002 Santjer - Conditional Preliminary Approval
 
Good afternoon,
 
Attached please find correspondence in regards to your parcel combination application.  Please
contact me directly with any questions.
 
Thank you,
 

Kelly Bacon
Planner I
Kittitas County Community Development Services
411 N. Ruby Street, Ste 2
Ellensburg, WA 98926
Office: (509) 962-7539
Kelly.bacon.cd@co.kittitas.wa.us
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Please Note:  In an effort to mitigate the spread of COVID-19 and the Governor’s "Safe Start" reopening plan, Kittitas
County Community Development Services is currently in Phase 3 and is open to the public in a limited capacity. At
this time many of us are on a rotating schedule working from home and in the office; during this time I will do my
best to respond to you as promptly as possible.
 
 


